
                               
 

  

          ANNEX A 
 

FOI DOF/2025-0233 
 
 
Request 
 
Re: Grade 7 competition IRC306697. 
 
I would like to request information in connection with the above mentioned 
competition under the Freedom of Information Act. 
 
Please treat each of the request below as separate requests. 
 
1. Please detail the number of applications that were sifted out of the competition 

for failing to provide specific dates. 
 
2. Please detail the number of applications that did not provide specific "to" dates 

in one or both of the criteria responses yet progressed to interview after the 
sift process (for clarity this would include applications that stated they were 
currently or presently still in the role being discussed in their example without 
providing a specific date). 

 
3. Please detail the number of "requests for review" that were received that 

focused on failing to provide specific dates.  
 
4. Please detail the number of "requests for review" that focused on failing to 

provide specific dates that were successful in overturning the original decision. 
 
5. Please provide the overall number of "requests for review" that were received.  
 
6. Please provide the overall number of "requests for review" hat were 

successful in overturning the original decision.  
 
7. Please provide a copy of all guidance (formal and informal) that was provided 

to anyone that was involved in the original sift process. 
 
8. Please provide a copy of all guidance (formal and informal) that was provided 

to anyone that was involved in the review process. 
 
9. Please provide a copy of all guidance (formal and informal), including internal 

policies, that details when and how candidates should and should not receive 
results from competitions. 

 
 
DoF Response 
 
I can confirm the department holds some of the information requested. 
 

1. The number sifted out due to dates alone is not held.   
 



                               
 

  

2. This information is not held in this format. 
 
3. This information is not held in this format. 
 
4. This information is not held in this format. 
 
5. This information is exempt under Section 21(1) of the Freedom of Information 

Act. Section 21 applies to information that is already reasonably accessible to 
the applicant by other means. Section 21 is an absolute exemption and the 
department is not required to consider whether the public interest favours 
disclosure of this information. The information is available at the following link: 
g7-general-faqs-to-satisfy-fois---march-2025.pdf 

 
6. The information requested is being withheld under Section 22 of the FOI Act 

as it is intended for future publication. By applying Section 22 Exemption of 
the FOI Act, we are required to carry out a Public Interest Test. This can be 
found attached as a separate document (Annex B). The information will be 
available at the following link: g7-general-faqs-to-satisfy-fois---march-2025.pdf 

 
7. Guidance on sifts are covered on the compulsory panel member training. No 

documentation is available.   
 

8. No guidance was required/issued. 
 

9. HR connect process will issue results at the completion of each stage, no 
documentation available on this.  
 

https://irecruit-ext.hrconnect.nigov.net/resources/documents/g/7/-/g7-general-faqs-to-satisfy-fois---march-2025.pdf
https://irecruit-ext.hrconnect.nigov.net/resources/documents/g/7/-/g7-general-faqs-to-satisfy-fois---march-2025.pdf



