
ANNEX A 
 

FOI DOF/2025-0338 
 
Request 
 
Re: the introduction and stagnation of the Shift Disturbance Allowance Ceiling. 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I am writing to request the following 
information relating to the introduction of the shift disturbance allowance ceiling in 
the Northern Ireland Civil Service (NICS) handbook in 2005, and the subsequent 
decision to stop raising this ceiling in 2008: 
 
1. Documentation and communications related to the decision-making process 

which led to the introduction in 2005 of the "shift disturbance and night duty 
allowance: ceiling and floor payments" (currently detailed in annex 1 of section 
8.24 of the NICS handbook) including: 

o Internal departmental correspondence 
o Minutes or notes of meetings 
o Policy papers, business cases, or briefing notes 
o Any documents outlining the rationale for the ceiling, its introduction 

and any planned rises or reviews in future years. 
 

2. Details of negotiations with the Trade Union Side regarding the introduction of 
the shift allowance ceiling, including: 

o Minutes of meetings between the Department and the Trade Union 
Side 

o Correspondence or records of consultation 
o Drafts or final versions of any relevant pay agreements or memoranda 

of understanding 
 

3. Information and documentation concerning the 2008 decision to stop raising 
the shift allowance ceiling, including: 

o Policy papers, internal memos, or briefing notes 
o Any analysis or impact assessments conducted at the time 
o Records of discussions with Trade Union representatives on this issue 

 
4. A copy of the pay agreement(s) that established the shift allowance ceiling 

and any amendments or relevant annexes from 2005 through 2008 - please 
note there is no reference to the introduction of this allowance in the pay 
agreements currently available on the DOF website 

 
 
DoF Response 
 
I can confirm the Department holds some of the information requested. 
 

1.  Payment for Shift and Night working was first introduced through negotiations 
with the relevant Trades Unions in 1971 and from the outset the concept of a 
‘floor’ and ‘ceiling’ rate of payment was agreed.   
 



When requested as part of annual pay discussions those rates have been 
discussed and negotiated with unions. 
 
Whilst the published HR Handbook chapter only shows rates from 2005, it does 
not imply the introduction of a new capping arrangement that did not already 
exist.  
 
 
2.  The Department of Finance does not hold the records referred to in terms of 
minutes of meetings etc. going back to 1971, but does retain the final Civil 
Service Circular (CSC 36-71) that was issued to Departments at the time.  A copy 
of this document has been attached at Annex B for reference.  Point 11 details 
the inclusion of a ceiling and floor to any payment due as part of the terms of the 
agreement.  
 
 
3.  The Department of Finance does not hold any record of discussion or decision 
to freeze the ceiling cap on the payment of Shift Disturbance Allowance.  
Although the ceiling has not been raised over recent years, it remains open to 
discussion and negotiation through pay claims from Trades Unions. 
 
 
4. This information is not held.  The establishment of the floor and ceiling for 
payment goes back to the 1971 agreement, as attached at Annex B.   
 
Annex C also shows a Civil Service Circular (CSC 18/00) dated February 2001 
that was issued to Departments at that time to announce an increase in the floor 
and ceiling levels of Shift Disturbance Allowance.  
 
The most recent update to rates being CSC 4-07, attached at Annex D, which 
reflect the published HR Handbook chapter.  The caps remain open to review. 
 




