
                               
 

  

ANNEX A 
 

FOI DOF/2025-0721 
 

 
Request 
 
Re competition IRC317873 
 
1. How many candidates got offered an interview for the EO2 competition? 
2. How many sought to reschedule due to ill health? 
3. How many candidates out of the number who asked for a reschedule got their 

request accepted? 
 
 
 
 
 
DoF response 
 
I can confirm the department holds some of the information requested. 
 
1. 1998 candidates got offered an interview for the EO2 competition. 
2. This information is not held. 
3. This information is not held. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


	Yours sincerely

