ANNEX A

FOI DOF/2026-0190

Request

RE: DOF/2026-0104 FOI Response / IRC265807 EO1 Competition

1.
2.

3.
4. How many were removed from the EO1 merit list due to non-acceptance of their

How many have been posted to an EO1 position?

How many did not accept their original posting/offer but were subsequently
offered and posted to another EO1 position?

How many decided to withdraw from the competition?

original offer?

DoF response

| can confirm the department holds some of the information requested.

1.

2.

A total of 1107 candidates have been posted to EO1 positions.

A total of 69 candidates did not accept their original posting/offer but were
subsequently offered and posted to another EO1 position.

This information is not held. It is not possible to confirm from records held
whether a candidate withdrew at their own request or was withdrawn due to
failure to comply with offer/acceptance process.

This information is not held. The reasons that lead to a candidate being
removed from the merit list are not recorded.



	Yours sincerely



