
                               
 

  

 
 

          ANNEX A 
 

FOI DOF/2022-0424 
 

 
Request 
 
I would be grateful if the following information could be provided to me: 
 
1. How many Grade 3 posts are there in NICS? 
2. How many of those posts are occupied by men and how many are occupied 

by women? 
3. In the last 5 years, how many of those posts have been offered with a 

stipulation that they are full-time and how many have been offered on the 
basis of alternative working patterns? 

4. Has NICS HR ever undertaken a section 75 assessment of its policies 
for/approach to filling SCS posts? If it has, please provide a copy of the 
assessment. 

5. please provide a copy of any advice that NICSHR has provided/received in 
the last 5 years regarding the stipulation that a SCS post* must be filled on a 
full-time basis. 

 
For the avoidance of doubt, the reference to Grade 3 posts includes substantive 
posts, time-limited posts and posts offered on a TP basis.  
 
In your clarification dated 28th November you agreed to limit to G3 only 
 
 
 
 
DoF Response 
 
I can confirm the department holds some of the information requested. 
 

1. The Department of Finance does not centrally hold the Civil Service staff 
establishment information, rather each Civil Service department is 
responsible for managing its resources – both financial and staff. Each 
department determines its individual workforce needs and is responsible 
for ensuring that any additional staffing resources are affordable.  

 
Information is held centrally in relation to the staff in post position. At the 
end of October 2022 there were 53 employees working at Senior Civil 
Service Grade 3. This figure includes staff temporarily promoted to Grade 
3 and excludes substantive Grade 3 staff temporarily promoted to a higher 
grade.  

 
2. Of the 53 employees working at Grade 3, 28 are recorded as male with 25 

recorded as female. 
 



                               
 

  

3. The decision regarding the status of each individual Grade 3 post and the 
basis on how it should be filled is taken by the Civil Service department 
with the vacancy, taking into consideration the nature of the job role, the 
remit and responsibilities.   
 
An examination of the records for the last 5 years indicated as follows: 
 
Grade 3 appointments  
 

• There were 32 competitions.  
• For 30 of those competitions, the Candidate Information Booklet 

stipulated that the position was full-time.  
• 1 Candidate Information Booklet advised that the position was full-

time but that alternative working patterns would be considered. 
• 1 Candidate Information Booklet did not specify a working pattern. 

 
Temporary Promotion to Grade 3  
 

• There were 32 temporary promotion arrangements, 6 of which 
NICSHR was involved in the process.  

• Of those 6, 1 specifically asked for full-time and 5 advised that staff 
working alternative working patterns were welcome to apply but 
needed to ensure full-time hours were covered for the duration of 
the temporary promotion. 

• The remaining 26 were managed by the respective departments 
(without the involvement of NICSHR); therefore, the Department of 
Finance does not hold information on the working pattern 
stipulations. 

 
4. The Department of Finance does not hold the information requested as it 

has not undertaken a section 75 assessment of its policies for/approach to 
filling SCS posts. 

 
5. The Department of Finance does not hold additional information to that 

provided under question 3 in relation to NICSHR having provided or 
received any advice regarding the stipulation that a Grade 3 post must be 
filled on a full-time basis. 

 
 
 
 

 




