
                               
 

  

ANNEX A 
 

FOI DOF/2024-0260 
 

 
Request 
 
Re: The latest pay award published 22 April 2024 NICS Pay Bulletin 2 24 - 
Industrial Pay Award 2023 (finance-ni.gov.uk) 
 
1. Can you advise the number who current civil servants who have not been in 

continuous NICS paid service with 90 days or more during the reporting year 
(1 April 2022 to 31 March 2023); 
 

2. Can you advise of this number how many in the week prior to employment 
with NICS were employed by UK civil service? 

 
 
 
 
DoF Response 
 
I can confirm the department holds some of the information requested. 
 
1. Although the Department does not hold current numbers to respond to this 

request, data held to enable the processing of the 2023 pay award shows that, 
as at 1 August 2023, 476 members of staff in the Civil Service did not have 
the necessary 90 days’ service in order to be eligible to receive either a step 
progression or the non-consolidated payment associated with that award. 

 
2. This information is not held by the Department.  

https://www.finance-ni.gov.uk/sites/default/files/publications/dfp/NICS%20Pay%20Bulletin%202%2024%20-%20Industrial%20Pay%20Award%202023.pdf
https://www.finance-ni.gov.uk/sites/default/files/publications/dfp/NICS%20Pay%20Bulletin%202%2024%20-%20Industrial%20Pay%20Award%202023.pdf

	Yours sincerely,



